
Draw Date: 
Draw # 

Annual Payments Option
Total Annual Payment 

Jackpot Amount Per 
Each Ticket Sold: 78,000,000.00

Number of Annual 
Payments Jackpot Prize 

Tickets Sold: 0

Annual Payments 
Combined Jackpot Prize 

Amount: 0.00

Initial Payment
(First Cash Payment) 2,600,000.00

29 Annual Payments 0.00
 (Matured Investments)

Cash Value Option

Cash Value Jackpot Prize 
Amount Per Each Ticket 

Sold: 43,757,223.10

Number of Cash Value 
Option Jackpot Prize 

Tickets Sold: 1
Cash Value Combined 
Jackpot Prize Amount: 43,757,223.10

Jackpot Prize Calculation

Advertised Jackpot Amount $78,000,000

Cost of 29 Investments 40,927,295.41
Initial Payment (excluding excess available) 2,600,000.00
Cost of 30 Payments (excluding excess available) 43,527,295.41

Amount Available (applicable sales contribution for the jackpot (1st) prize.) 43,757,223.10
Difference Between Amount Available and the Cost of 30 Payments 229,927.69

Additional Sales Contribution Increase 229,927.69
(The excess will be divided equally between each jackpot prize share.

For the annual payments option, the excess funds will be applied to the initial payment.)

Total Cost of Prizes (Including Excess Available) 43,757,223.10

Decrease in Authorized Sources 0.00

Prepared by: Date

Reviewed by: Date

Approved by: Date

Saturday, November 15, 2025
3666

Lotto Texas ®  Drawing Results Form
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Casarez, Jessica

From: Vanessa Robles <Vanessa.Robles@ttstc.texas.gov>
Sent: Monday, November 17, 2025 8:42 AM
To: Casarez, Jessica; Galvan, Jessica; Pair, Tia; Guarnero, Annika
Cc: TTSTC Internal Investments
Subject: FW: Lotto Texas CVO winner 11/15/2025
Attachments: 11.17.25.pdf

Sensitivity: Confidential

CAUTION: This email originated outside the Texas Lottery's email system. 
DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you expect them from the sender and know the content is 
safe.  

Good morning, 
 
Reviewed and approved – see attached interest factor. 
 
Thanks, 
 
 
Vanessa M Robles 
Trader/Investment Analyst | Internal Investments 
Phone: 512-475-0611 | Fax: 512-463-6040 
vanessa.robles@ttstc.texas.gov 
 

 
 
 

From: Lisa Moore <Lisa.Moore@ttstc.texas.gov>  
Sent: Monday, November 17, 2025 8:38 AM 
To: TTSTC Internal Investments <ttstc.intinv@ttstc.texas.gov> 
Subject: FW: Lotto Texas CVO winner 11/15/2025 
Sensitivity: Confidential 
 
Please approve and send to lottery.  Thanks.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
___________________________________ 

Lisa Moore | Investment Analyst 
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phone. 512.463.7287 | fax. 512.463.6040  
lisa.moore@ttstc.texas.gov | lfeu030@bloomberg.net  

 
 
 

From: Casarez, Jessica <Jessica.Casarez@lottery.state.tx.us>  
Sent: Monday, November 17, 2025 8:35 AM 
To: TTSTC Internal Investments <ttstc.intinv@ttstc.texas.gov> 
Cc: Annika Guarnero <Annika.Guarnero@lottery.state.tx.us>; Galvan, Jessica <Jessica.Galvan@lottery.state.tx.us>; Pair, 
Tia <Tia.Pair@lottery.state.tx.us> 
Subject: FW: Lotto Texas CVO winner 11/15/2025 
Sensitivity: Confidential 
 

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the Texas Comptroller's email system.  
DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you expect them from the sender and know the content 

is safe.  
Review and approval requested for Lotto Texas CVO Inquiry.     

        

Subject: 
Cash Value Option Non-Purchase (Trade 
Inquiry)  

   

 1 Cash Value Option Ticket(s)     

 Lotto Draw # 3666 Draw Date  11/15/2025    

        

DO NOT PURCHASE THIS INVESTMENT THIS IS FOR INFORMATIONAL 
PURPOSES ONLY. 

 
 

 

        

Please solicit information regarding the cost to pay an annual installment 
of    

over 30 years for a total payout of  $78,000,000     

        

If you have any questions, please call.      

        

Jessica Casarez (512) 344-5410     

        

      

      

        

        

check figures       

 Draw Date 
Draw 

Number Adv Jackpot 

Est. Annual 
Payment 

(1st year cash est.)  
   

 11/15/2025 #3666 $78,000,000.00 M $2,600,000    
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From: Brandy Myers <Brandy.Myers@tdlr.texas.gov>  
Sent: Monday, November 17, 2025 8:27 AM 
To: Casarez, Jessica <Jessica.Casarez@lottery.state.tx.us> 
Cc: Guarnero, Annika <Annika.Guarnero@lottery.state.tx.us> 
Subject: Re: [ External Email ] Lotto Texas CVO winner 11/15/2025 
Sensitivity: Confidential 
 

CAUTION: This email originated outside the Texas Lottery's email system. 
DO NOT click links or open attachments unless you expect them from the sender and know the content is 
safe.  

Approved  
 
Brandy M. Myers 
Chief Financial Officer 
Office of the Controller  
Texas Department of Licensing and Regulation 

From: Casarez, Jessica <Jessica.Casarez@lottery.state.tx.us> 
Sent: Monday, November 17, 2025 8:25:16 AM 
To: Brandy Myers <Brandy.Myers@tdlr.texas.gov> 
Cc: Guarnero, Annika <Annika.Guarnero@lottery.state.tx.us> 
Subject: [ External Email ] Lotto Texas CVO winner 11/15/2025  
  
'  

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization! Do not click links, open attachments or reply, unless you 
recognize the sender's email address and know the content is safe! 

'  
Review and approval requested for Lotto Texas CVO Inquiry.        

           

Subject: 
Cash Value Option Non-Purchase (Trade 
Inquiry)     

   

 1 Cash Value Option Ticket(s)     
   

 Lotto Draw # 3666 Draw Date  11/15/2025   
   

           

DO NOT PURCHASE THIS INVESTMENT THIS IS FOR INFORMATIONAL PURPOSES 
ONLY. 

   

 
 

 
 

        
  

Please solicit information regarding the cost to pay an annual installment 
of   $2,600,000  

  

over 30 years for a total payout of  $78,000,000     
  

        
  

If you have any questions, please call.      
  

        
  

Jessica Casarez (512) 344-5410     
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check figures       
  

 Draw Date 
Draw 

Number Adv Jackpot 

Est. Annual 
Payment 

(1st year cash est.)     

  

 11/15/2025 #3666 $78,000,000.00 M $2,600,000    
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